



# The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

## 1. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Automotive Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Parts

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Industrial Power	Aisin pricelist	60%	No
Advanced Fleet Maintenance	Advanced Fleet Maintenance pricelist	10%	Yes
Industrial Power	Allison pricelist	60%	Yes
Reliable Transmission Service	Allison Transmission-Parts pricelist	20%	No
Arnold Oil Company	Arnold Oil pricelist (25% discount to 45% discount)	25%	Yes
Industrial Power	AutoCar pricelist	60%	Yes
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Blagg Tire and Service Keller pricelist	2%	No
Blagg Tire and Service	Blagg Tire and Service pricelist	2%	No
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln, LTD	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	28%	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Burnett Family Tire of Canton pricelist	2%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Burnett Family Tire of Mabank pricelist	2%	No
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
C. C. Battery Co.	C.C. Battery Co. pricelist	55%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	Yes
Chalk's Truck Parts	Chalk's Bus Parts pricelist	50%	Yes
Chastang Enterprises, Inc.	Chastang Ford pricelist	15%	Yes
Classic Chevrolet Sugar Land LLC	Classic Chevrolet pricelist	35%	Yes
College Station Auto Parts	College Station Auto Parts and Equipment pricelist (12% discount to 50% discount)	12%	Yes
Texas Truck AC Inc.	CoolPoint pricelist	20%	Yes
Industrial Power	Cummins pricelist	50%	Yes
Industrial Power	Detroit Diesel pricelist	60%	No
Downtown Garage	Downtown Garage pricelist	2%	No
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	Yes
Industrial Power	Hino pricelist	50%	Yes
Industrial Power	Isuzu pricelist	80%	Yes



# The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

1. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Automotive Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Parts			
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Jordan's Car Care Mesquite pricelist	2%	No
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Jordan's Car Care Rowlett pricelist	2%	No
Kinney's Automotive Service	Kinney's Automotive Service pricelist	2%	No
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Dallas Dodge Chrysler Jeep Parts	Mopar pricelist (20% discount to 30% discount)	20%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	10%	Yes
Oppel Tire & Service	Oppel Tire & Service pricelist	2%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
RAM Products, Ltd.	RAM Products pricelist (46% discount to 62% discount)	46%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Rick's Car Care Beltline Road pricelist	2%	No
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd.	Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd. pricelist	2%	No
Swink Air & Hydraulics	Swink Air & Hydraulics pricelist	0%	Yes
Texas Alternator Starter Service	Texas Alternator pricelist	30%	Yes
Wood Alternator and Starter Service	Wood Alternator pricelist	2%	No



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 2. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Automotive Non-Original Equipment Manufacturer (Non-OEM) Parts

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Advanced Starter Service	Advanced Starter Service pricelist	5%	Yes
Industrial Power	Allison pricelist	60%	No
Andy's Auto & Bus Air	Andy's Auto and Bus Air pricelist	20%	Yes
Arnold Oil Company	Arnold Oil pricelist (40% discount to 60% discount)	40%	Yes
Industrial Power	Autocar pricelist	60%	No
Northwest Drive Train	Baldwin pricelist	57%	Yes
Battery Systems, Inc.	Battery Systems pricelist	25%	Yes
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Blagg Tire and Service Keller pricelist	2%	No
Blagg Tire and Service	Blagg Tire and Service pricelist	2%	No
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln, LTD.	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	15%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Burnett Family Tire of Canton pricelist	2%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Burnett Family Tire of Mabank pricelist	2%	No
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
C. C. Battery Co.	C.C. Battery Co. pricelist	55%	Yes
CD Starter Service	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	Yes
Chalk's Bus Parts	Chalk's Bus Parts pricelist	50%	Yes
Chastang Enterprises, Inc.	Chastang Ford pricelist	15%	No
College Station Auto Parts	College Station Auto Parts and Equipment pricelist (12% discount to 50% discount)	12%	Yes
Industrial Power	ConMet Wheel Ends pricelist	50%	Yes
Texas Truck AC Inc.	CoolPoint pricelist	20%	Yes
Industrial Power	Cummings pricelist	60%	No
Downtown Garage	Downtown Garage pricelist	2%	No
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	Yes
Northwest Drive Train	Gates pricelist	20%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	20%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 2. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Automotive Non-Original Equipment Manufacturer (Non-OEM) Parts

Northwest Drive Train	Gunite pricelist	0%	Yes
Industrial Power	Hino pricelist	60%	No
Industrial Power	Isuzu pricelist	60%	No
Jasper Engines & Transmissions	Jasper Engines & Transmissions pricelist	15%	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Jordan's Car Care Rowlett pricelist	2%	No
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Jordan's Care Care Mesquite pricelist	2%	No
Kinney's Automotive Service	Kinney's Automotive Service pricelist	2%	No
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Northwest Drive Train	Meritor pricelist	20%	Yes
Genuine Parts Company dba NAPA	NAPA pricelist	50%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	10%	No
Oppel Tire & Service	Oppel Tire & Service pricelist	2%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
Plastix Plus LLC	Plastix Plus pricelist	5%	Yes
R&S Texas Parts Co.	R&S Texas Parts pricelist (3% discount to 35% discount)	3%	Yes
RAM Products, Ltd.	RAM Products pricelist (46% discount to 62% discount)	46%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Rick's Car Care Beltline Road pricelist	2%	No
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd.	Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd. pricelist	2%	No
Swink Air & Hydraulics	Swink Air & Hydraulics pricelist	0%	Yes
Texas Alternator Starter Service	Texas Alternator pricelist	30%	Yes
Thin Line Upfitters LLC	Thin Line Upfitters pricelist	5%	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	20%	Yes
Wood Alternator and Starter Service	Wood Alternator pricelist	2%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 3. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Batteries (All Types of Automotive and Marine)

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Arnold Oil Company	Arnold Oil pricelist (25% discount to 40% discount)	25%	Yes
Batteries Plus Bulbs 468	Batteries Plus Bulbs pricelist (16% discount to 35% discount)	16%	No
Batteries Plus, LLC	Batteries Plus pricelist	30%	Yes
Battery Systems, Inc	Battery Systems pricelist	25%	Yes
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Blagg Tire and Service Keller pricelist	2%	No
Blagg Tire and Service	Blagg Tire and Service pricelist	2%	No
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln, LTD	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	15%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Burnett Family Tire of Canton pricelist	2%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Burnett Family Tire of Mabank pricelist	2%	No
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
C. C. Battery Co.	C.C. Battery Co. pricelist	55%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	No
Chalk's Truck Parts	Chalk's Truck Parts pricelist	50%	Yes
Chastang Enterprises, Inc.	Chastang Ford pricelist	10%	No
College Station Auto Parts	College Station Auto Parts and Equipment pricelist (12% discount to 50% discount)	12%	Yes
Downtown Garage	Downtown Garage pricelist	2%	No
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	20%	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Jordan's Car Care Mequite pricelist	2%	No
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Jordan's Car Care Rowlett pricelist	2%	No
Kinney's Automotive Service	Kinney's Automotive Service pricelist	2%	No
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 3. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Batteries (All Types of Automotive and Marine)

Genuine Parts Company NAPA	NAPA pricelist	50%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	15%	No
Oppel Tire & Service	Oppel Tire & Service pricelist	2%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist	15%	Yes
RAM Products, Ltd.	RAM Products pricelist (46% discount to 62% discount)	46%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Rick's Car Care Beltline Road pricelist	2%	No
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd.	Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd. pricelist	2%	No
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	20%	Yes
Vanguard Truck Center of Austin	Vanguard pricelist	40%	Yes
Wood Alternator and Starter Service	Wood Alternator pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 4. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Mobile Lift Systems, Support Stands, and Jacks

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	American Forge & Foundry - Surewerx pricelist	35%	Yes
ARI Phoenix, Inc.	ARI Phoenix pricelist	15%	Yes
Arnold Oil Company	Arnold Oil pricelist (25% discount to 50% discount)	25%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Bend Pak pricelist	55%	Yes
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln, LTD.	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	0%	No
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	Yes
Chalk's Truck Parts	Chalk's Bus Parts pricelist	50%	Yes
Rykin Pump Company, Inc.	Challenger Lift Systems pricelist	15%	No
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Challenger Lifts pricelist	55%	Yes
College Station Auto Parts	College Station Auto Parts and Equipment pricelist (12% discount to 50% discount)	12%	Yes
Delegard Tools of Texas, Inc.	Delegard Tools of Texas pricelist (5% discount to 40% discount)	5%	No
JF Petroleum Group	Forward Lifts pricelist	30%	No
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Forward Lifts pricelist	55%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	15%	No
LiftNow Automotive	Mahle pricelist	35%	Yes
Kyrieh Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrieh Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Genuine Parts Company NAPA	NAPA pricelist	50%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	15%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist (3% discount to 35% discount)	3%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Rotary Lift pricelist	55%	Yes
JF Petroleum Group	Rotary pricelist (25% discount to 30% discount)	25%	No
Reeder Distributors, Inc.	Stertil-Koni pricelist	29%	Yes



---

## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

---

4. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Mobile Lift Systems, Support Stands, and Jacks			
---	--	--	--

Swink Air & Hydraulics	Swink Air & Hydraulics pricelist	0%	Yes
Texas Pride Marketing	Texas Pride Marketing pricelist	5%	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	15%	Yes
Wood Alternator and Starter Service	Wood Alternator pricelist	2%	Yes





## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 5. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Automotive Hand Tools

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
JF Petroleum Group	Alemite pricelist	30%	No
Arnold Oil Company	Arnold Oil pricelist (45% discount to 55% discount)	45%	Yes
Austin Mac Haik Ford Lincoln, LTD.	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	0%	Yes
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	No
Charter Chemical Solutions	Charter Chemical Solutions pricelist	15%	No
College Station Auto Parts	College Station Auto Parts and Equipment pricelist (12% discount to 50% discount)	12%	Yes
Delegard Tool of Texas, Inc.	Delegard Tool of Texas pricelist (5% to 40% discount)	5%	Yes
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	20%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Rykin Pump Company, Inc.	Milton pricelist	20%	Yes
Genuine Parts Company dba NAPA	NAPA pricelist	50%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	15%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co.- NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist	10%	Yes
Ram Products, Ltd.	RAM Products pricelist (46% discount to 62% discount)	46%	Yes
Texas Pride Marketing	Texas Pride Marketing pricelist	5%	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	20%	Yes
Wood Alternator and Starter Service	Wood Alternator pricelist	2%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

6. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Alternative Fuel Engine Conversion Kits for Fleet Vehicles and Buses (All Makes/Models, domestic and foreign)

<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Vendor Catalog Information</b>	<b>Percent Discount</b>	<b>Award</b>
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	No
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride Full Parts pricelist	62%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 7. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Fleet Maintenance/Work Order Systems

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Blagg Tire and Service Keller pricelist	2%	No
Blagg Tire and Service	Blagg Tire and Service pricelist	2%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Burnett Family Tire of Canton pricelist	2%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Burnett Family Tire of Mabank pricelist	2%	No
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	No
Downtown Garage	Downtown Garage pricelist	2%	No
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Jordan's Car Care Mesquite pricelist	2%	No
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Jordan's Car Care Rowlett pricelist	2%	No
Kinney's Automotive Service	Kinney's Automotive Service pricelist	2%	No
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	5%	Yes
Oppel Tire & Service	Oppel Tire & Service pricelist	2%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist	10%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Rick's Car Care Beltline Road pricelist	2%	No
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd	Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd. pricelist	2%	No



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 8. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Other Automotive Related Parts

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Air Cleaning Specialists pricelist	8%	No
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Aircom pricelist	2%	Yes
Reliable Transmission Service	Allison Transmission pricelist	0%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	AMMCO Coats pricelist	55%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Autel pricelist	9%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Autostacker pricelist	0%	No
Reeder Distributors	Balcrank pricelist	15%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Bend Pak OE Parts pricelist (9% discount to 55% discount)	9%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Bennett Pump pricelist	10%	Yes
BG Products	BG pricelist	6%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	BJE pricelist	15%	Yes
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Blagg Tire and Service Keller pricelist	2%	Yes
Blagg Tire and Service	Blagg Tire and Service pricelist	2%	Yes
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln, LTD	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	15%	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Burnett Family Tire of Canton pricelist	2%	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Burnett Family Tire of Mabank pricelist	2%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Burroughs pricelist	15%	No
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
C.C. Battery Co.	C.C. Battery Co. pricelist	55%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	Yes
Chalk's Truck Parts	Chalk's Bus Parts pricelist	50%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Challenger pricelist (20% discount to 55% discount)	20%	Yes
JF Petroleum Group	Champion Air Compressors pricelist	47%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Champion Air Dryer pricelist	15%	Yes
JF Petroleum Group	Champion Air Treatment & Aftermarket equipment/supplies pricelist	20%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 8. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Other Automotive Related Parts

Reeder Distributors	Champion Compressor pricelist	15%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Champion Rotary Screw pricelist	15%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Chassisliner pricelist	2%	Yes
Chastang Enterprises, Inc.	Chastang Ford pricelist	15%	Yes
Classic Chevrolet Sugar Land LLC	Classic Chevrolet pricelist	35%	Yes
College Station Auto Parts	College Station Auto Parts and Equipment pricelist (12% discount to 50% discount)	12%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Containment Solutions pricelist	10%	Yes
Downtown Garage	Downtown Garage pricelist	2%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	EnergyLogic pricelist	10%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Entramatic pricelist	5%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	EuroVent pricelist	10%	Yes
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	FleetPride pricelist	62%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Flo-Dynamics pricelist	15%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Fluidall pricelist	5%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Forward Lift pricelist	55%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Forward pricelist	12%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Fuel Master pricelist	12%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Goliath Carts pricelist	10%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	0%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Graco pricelist	15%	Yes
Rykin Pump Company, Inc.	Graco pricelist	15%	Yes
JF Petroleum Group	Graco pricelist	25%	Yes
Advanced Starter Service	Grote pricelist	5%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Hunter pricelist (5% discount to 10% discount)	5%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	John Dow pricelist	10%	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Jordan's Car Care Mesquite pricelist	2%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 8. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Other Automotive Related Parts

Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Jordan's Car Care Rowlett pricelist	2%	Yes
Kinney's Automotive Service	Kinney's Automotive Service pricelist	2%	Yes
JF Petroleum Group	Lincoln pricelist	30%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Lincoln pricelist	10%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Mahle pricelist	35%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Mattei Compressors pricelist	15%	No
Rykin Pump Company, Inc.	Milton pricelist	20%	Yes
Genuine Parts Company - NAPA	NAPA pricelist	50%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	10%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	NAPA pricelist	10%	No
Reeder Distributors	Norco pricelist	10%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Omer pricelist	5%	No
Oppel Tire & Service	Oppel Tire & Service pricelist	2%	Yes
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
Reeder Distributors	PeeDee Tanks pricelist	15%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	QSP pricelist	5%	Yes
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist	3%	Yes
Ram Products, Ltd.	RAM Products pricelist (46% discount to 62% discount)	46%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Ranger pricelist	13%	No
JF Petroleum Group	Reelcraft pricelist	10%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Rick's Car Care Beltline Road pricelist	2%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd	Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd. pricelist	2%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 8. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Other Automotive Related Parts

Reeder Distributors	Rotary Lift pricelist	20%	No
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Rotary pricelist (25% discount to 55% discount)	25%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Rotary Wheel Service pricelist	20%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Roth pricelist	15%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Saylor Beal pricelist	20%	Yes
JF Petroleum Group	Saylor-Beall Compressors pricelist	37%	Yes
Rykin Pump Company, Inc.	Saylor-Beall pricelist	10%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Shure Manufacturing pricelist	5%	Yes
Reeder Distributors	Shure pricelist	10%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Stanwade pricelist	8%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Surewerx - American Forge & Foundry pricelist	35%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Surewerx - Sellstrom/Jackson Safety Products pricelist	9%	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	SVI pricelist	5%	Yes
Swink Air & Hydraulics	Swink Air & Hydraulics pricelist	0%	Yes
Texas Pride Marketing	Texas Pride Marketing pricelist	5%	Yes
Thin Line Upfitters LLC	Thin Line Upfitters pricelist	5%	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

9. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Automotive Oils (for diesel engines, passenger vehicles, alternative fuel and natural gas motors, gear oils, miscellaneous oils, and related oils)

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Arnold Oil Company	Arnold Oil pricelist	50%	Yes
BG Products)	BG Products pricelist	6%	Yes
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Blagg Tire and Service Keller pricelist	2%	No
Blagg Tire and Service	Blagg Tire and Service pricelist	2%	No
Blender Direct	Blender Direct pricelist	0%	Yes
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln, Ltd.	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	15%	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Burnett Family Tire of Canton pricelist	2%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Burnett Family Tire of Mabank pricelist	2%	No
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	No
Certified Laboratories, A Div of NCH Corp.	Certified Labs pricelist	10%	Yes
Charter Chemical Solutions	Charter Chemical Solutions pricelist	20%	Yes
Chastang Enterprises, Inc.	Chastang Ford pricelist	10%	Yes
Chemsearch, A Div Of NCH	Chemsearch pricelist	10%	Yes
College Station Auto Parts	College Station Auto Parts and Equipment pricelist (12% discount to 50% discount)	12%	Yes
Texas Truck AC Inc.	CoolPoint pricelist	20%	Yes
Downtown Garage	Downtown Garage pricelist	2%	No
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	Yes
Texas Enterprises Inc	Golden West pricelist	0%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	10%	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Jordan's Car Care Mesquite pricelist	2%	No
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Jordan's Car Care Rowlett pricelist	2%	No
Kinney's Automotive Service	Kinney's Automotive Service pricelist	2%	No
Lubricant Product Supplies LLC	Lubricant Product Supplies pricelist	25%	Yes





## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

9. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Automotive Oils (for diesel engines, passenger vehicles, alternative fuel and natural gas motors, gear oils, miscellaneous oils, and related oils)
---

Lubrication Engineers, Inc.	Lubrication Engineers, Inc. pricelist	10%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Genuine Parts Company - NAPA	NAPA pricelist	50%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	10%	No
Oppel Tire & Service	Oppel Tire & Service pricelist	2%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist (2% discount to 15% discount)	10%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Rick's Car Care Beltline Road pricelist	2%	No
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd	Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd. pricelist	2%	No
Rotex Truck Center	Rotex Truck Center pricelist	20%	Yes
Schaeffer Manufacturing Company	Schaeffer Manufacturing Company pricelist	3%	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	10%	Yes
Vanguard Truck Center of Austin	Vanguard pricelist	45%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

10. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Transmission Fluids (for diesel engines, passenger vehicles, alternative fuel and natural gas motors, gear oils, miscellaneous oils, and related oils)

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Arnold Oil Company	Arnold Oil pricelist	50%	Yes
BG Products	BG Products pricelist	6%	Yes
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Blagg Tire and Service Keller pricelist	2%	No
Blagg Tire and Service	Blagg Tire and Service pricelist	2%	No
Blender Direct	Blender Direct pricelist	0%	Yes
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln, LTD	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	15%	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Burnett Family Tire of Canton pricelist	2%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Burnett Family Tire of Mabank pricelist	2%	No
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	No
Certified Laboratories, A Div of NCH Corp.	Certified Labs pricelist	10%	Yes
Chastang Enterprises, Inc.	Chastang Ford pricelist	10%	Yes
Chemsearch, A Div Of NCH	Chemsearch pricelist	10%	Yes
College Station Auto Parts	College Station Auto Parts and Equipment pricelist (12% discount to 50% discount)	12%	Yes
Downtown Garage	Downtown Garage pricelist	2%	No
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	Yes
Texas Enterprises Inc	Golden West pricelist	0%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	10%	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Jordan's Car Care Mesquite pricelist	2%	No
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Jordan's Car Care Rowlett pricelist	2%	No
Kinney's Automotive Service	Kinney's Automotive Service pricelist	2%	No
Lubricant Product Supplies LLC	Lubricant Product Supplies pricelist	25%	Yes
Lubrication Engineers, Inc.	Lubrication Engineers, Inc. pricelist	10%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

10. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Transmission Fluids (for diesel engines, passenger vehicles, alternative fuel and natural gas motors, gear oils, miscellaneous oils, and related oils)
--

Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Genuine Parts Company - NAPA	NAPA pricelist	50%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	10%	No
Oppel Tire & Service	Oppel Tire & Service pricelist	2%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist	5%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Rick's Car Care Beltline Road pricelist	2%	No
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd	Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd. pricelist	2%	No
Rotex Truck Center	Rotex Truck Center pricelist	20%	Yes
Schaeffer Manufacturing Company	Schaeffer Manufacturing Company pricelist	3%	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	10%	Yes
Vanguard Truck Center of Austin	Vanguard pricelist	40%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

11. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Grease Products for (for diesel engines, passenger vehicles, alternative fuel and natural gas motors, gear oils, miscellaneous oils, and related oils)

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Arnold Oil Company	Arnold Oil pricelist	50%	Yes
BG Products	BG Products pricelist	6%	Yes
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Blagg Tire and Service Keller pricelist	2%	No
Blagg Tire and Service	Blagg Tire and Service pricelist	2%	No
Blender Direct	Blender Direct pricelist	0%	Yes
Austin Mac Haik Ford Lincoln	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	15%	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Burnett Family Tire of Canton pricelist	2%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Burnett Family Tire of Mabank pricelist	2%	No
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	Yes
Certified Laboratories, A Div of NCH Corp.	Certified Labs pricelist	10%	Yes
Charter Chemical Solutions	Charter Chemical Solutions pricelist	20%	Yes
Chastang Enterprises, Inc.	Chastang Ford pricelist	10%	Yes
Chemsearch, A Div Of NCH	Chemsearch pricelist	10%	Yes
College Station Auto Parts	College Station Auto Parts and Equipment pricelist (12% discount to 50% discount)	12%	Yes
Downtown Garage	Downtown Garage pricelist	2%	No
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	Yes
Texas Enterprises Inc	Golden West pricelist	0%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	10%	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Jordan's Car Care Mesquite pricelist	2%	No
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Jordan's Car Care Rowlett pricelist	2%	No
Kinney's Automotive Service	Kinney's Automotive Service pricelist	2%	No
Lubricant Product Supplies LLC	Lubricant Product Supplies pricelist	25%	Yes
Lubrication Engineers, Inc.	Lubrication Engineers, Inc. pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

11. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Grease Products for (for diesel engines, passenger vehicles, alternative fuel and natural gas motors, gear oils, miscellaneous oils, and related oils)
--

Kyrish Truck Center	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Genuine Parts Company - NAPA	NAPA pricelist	50%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	10%	No
Oppel Tire & Service	Oppel Tire & Service pricelist	2%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist (3% discount to 10% discount	5%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Rick's Car Care Beltline Road pricelist	2%	No
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd	Rick's Car Care Irving pricelist	2%	No
Rotex Truck Center	Rotex Truck Center pricelist	20%	Yes
Schaeffer Manufacturing Company	Schaeffer Manufacturing Company pricelist	3%	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	10%	Yes
Vanguard Truck Center of Austin	Vanguard pricelist	60%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 12. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Additive and Lubricant Products

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
BG Products	BG Products pricelist	6%	Yes
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Blagg Tire and Service Keller pricelist	2%	No
Blagg Tire and Service	Blagg Tire and Service pricelist	2%	No
Blender Direct	Blender Direct pricelist	0%	Yes
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln, LTD	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	15%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Burnett Family Tire of Canton pricelist	2%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Burnett Family Tire of Mabank pricelist	2%	No
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	No
Certified Laboratories, A Div of NCH Corp.	Certified Labs pricelist	10%	Yes
Charter Chemical Solutions	Charter Chemical Solutions pricelist	20%	Yes
Chastang Enterprises, Inc.	Chastang Ford pricelist	10%	No
Chemsearch, A Div Of NCH	Chemsearch pricelist	10%	Yes
College Station Auto Parts	College Station Auto Parts and Equipment pricelist (12% discount to 50% discount)	12%	Yes
Downtown Garage	Downtown Garage pricelist	2%	No
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	Yes
Texas Enterprises Inc	Golden West pricelist	0%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	10%	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Jordan's Car Care Mesquite pricelist	2%	No
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Jordan's Car Care Rowlett pricelist	2%	No
Kinney's Automotive Service	Kinney's Automotive Service pricelist	2%	No
LMS Sales & Service LLC	LMS Sales & Service LLC pricelist	10%	Yes
Lubrication Engineers, Inc.	Lubrication Engineers, Inc. pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 12. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Additive and Lubricant Products

Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Genuine Parts Company - NAPA	NAPA pricelist	50%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	10%	No
Oppel Tire & Service	Oppel Tire & Service pricelist	2%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist (5% discount to 12% discount)	6%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Rick's Car Care Beltline Road pricelist	2%	No
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd	Rick's Car Care Irving pricelist	2%	No
Rotex Truck Center	Rotex Truck Center pricelist	20%	Yes
Schaeffer Manufacturing Company	Schaeffer Manufacturing Company pricelist	3%	Yes
The Fuel Ox LLC	The Fuel Ox LLC pricelist	35%	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	10%	Yes
Vanguard Truck Center of Austin	Vanguard pricelist	80%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 13. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Oil Collection, Refining, Recycling, and Cleaning Services

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	No
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	No
Rykin Pump Company, Inc.	Graco pricelist	15%	Yes
Lubrication Engineers, Inc.	Lubrication Engineers, Inc. pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Rykin Pump Company, Inc.	Rykin Tanks and Totes pricelist	0%	Yes





## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 14. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Automotive Maintenance and Services (oil change, battery replacement, radiator flush, and related services)

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Blagg Tire and Service Keller pricelist	2%	Yes
Blagg Tire and Service	Blagg Tire and Service pricelist	2%	Yes
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln, LTD	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	15%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Burnett Family Tire of Canton pricelist	2%	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Burnett Family Tire of Mabank pricelist	2%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	No
Chastang Enterprises, Inc.	Chastang Ford pricelist	10%	No
Downtown Garage	Downtown Garage pricelist	2%	Yes
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	No
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	0%	No
Industrial Power	Industrial Power pricelist	20%	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Jordan's Car Care Mesquite pricelist	2%	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Jordan's Car Care Rowlett pricelist	2%	Yes
Kinney's Automotive Service	Kinney's Automotive Service pricelist	2%	Yes
LMS Sales & Service LLC	LMS Sales & Service LLC pricelist	10%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
Oppel Tire & Service	Oppel Tire & Service pricelist	2%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Rick's Car Care Beltline Road pricelist	2%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd	Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd pricelist	2%	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	0%	No
Lubrication Engineers, Inc.	Xamine Oil Analysis pricelist	0%	No



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 15. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Other Automotive Fluids

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Arnold Oil Company	Arnold Oil pricelist	50%	Yes
BG Products	BG Products pricelist	6%	Yes
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Blagg Tire and Service Keller pricelist	2%	No
Blagg Tire and Service	Blagg Tire and Service pricelist	2%	No
Blender Direct	Blender Direct pricelist	0%	Yes
Mack Haik Ford Lincoln, LTD	Blue Diamond Ford pricelist	15%	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Burnett Family Tire of Canton pricelist	2%	No
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Burnett Family Tire of Mabank pricelist	2%	No
Burton Auto Supply	Burton pricelist	50%	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	CD Starter Service pricelist	50%	No
Certified Laboratories, A Div of NCH Corp.	Certified Labs pricelist	10%	Yes
Charter Chemical Solutions	Charter Chemical Solutions pricelist	20%	Yes
Chastang Enterprises, Inc.	Chastang Ford pricelist	10%	Yes
College Station Auto Parts	College Station Auto Parts and Equipment pricelist (12% discount to 50% discount)	12%	Yes
Downtown Garage	Downtown Garage pricelist	2%	No
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Fleetpride pricelist	62%	Yes
Texas Enterprises Inc	Golden West pricelist	0%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	10%	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Jordan's Car Care Mesquite pricelist	2%	No
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Jordan's Car Care Rowlett pricelist	2%	No
Kinney's Automotive Service	Kinney's Automotive Service pricelist	2%	No
Lubricant Product Supplies LLC	Lubricant Product Supplies pricelist	25%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 15. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Other Automotive Fluids

Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	Yes
Genuine Parts Company - NAPA	NAPA pricelist	50%	Yes
M&M Auto and Truck Parts	NAPA pricelist	10%	No
Oppel Tire & Service	Oppel Tire & Service pricelist	2%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist (5% discount to 8% discount)	5%	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Rick's Car Care Beltline Road pricelist	2%	No
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd.	Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd. pricelist	2%	No
Rotex Truck Center	Rotex Truck Center pricelist	20%	Yes
Schaeffer Manufacturing Company	Schaeffer Manufacturing Company pricelist	3%	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	10%	Yes
Vanguard Truck Center of Austin	Vanguard pricelist	65%	Yes
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	Zerex pricelist	5%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 16. Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Bid Price	Award
Toro Auto Sales	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 59.95	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 59.95	Yes
JF Petroleum Group	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products (\$70.00 to \$85.00)	\$ 70.00	Yes
Burton Auto Supply	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 75.00	Yes
Texas Truck AC, Inc.	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 85.00	Yes
Blagg Tire and Service	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 98.00	Yes
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 98.00	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 98.00	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 98.00	Yes
Downtown Garage	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 98.00	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 98.00	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 98.00	Yes
Kinney's Automotive Service	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 98.00	Yes
Oppel Tire & Service	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 98.00	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 98.00	Yes
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd.	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 98.00	Yes
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 105.00	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

M&M Auto and Truck Parts	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$	125.00	Yes
--------------------------	--	----	--------	-----

16. Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Bid Price	Award
Reeder Distributors, Inc.	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 125.00	Yes
Reliable Transmission Service	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 130.00	Yes
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln pricelist	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 130.00	Yes
Industrial Power	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 135.00	Yes
Rotex Truck Center, Inc.	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 139.00	Yes
Vanguard Truck Center of Austin	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 145.00	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 150.00	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 150.00	Yes
Rykin Pump Company, Inc.	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 150.00	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 150.00	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 160.00	Yes
Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp.	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products (\$165.00 to \$599.00)	\$ 165.00	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Automotive Equipment and Products	\$ 170.00	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 17. Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Bid Price	Award
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 59.95	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 59.95	Yes
Texas Truck AC Inc.	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 85.00	Yes
Andy's Auto & Bus Air	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 85.00	Yes
Blagg Tire & Service Keller	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 98.00	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Canton	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 98.00	Yes
Burnett Family Tire of Mabank	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 98.00	Yes
Downtown Garage	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 98.00	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Mesquite	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 98.00	Yes
Jordan's Car Care Rowlett	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 98.00	Yes
Kinney's Automotive Service	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 98.00	Yes
Oppel Tire & Service	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 98.00	Yes
Rick's Car Care Beltline Road	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 98.00	Yes
Rick's Car Care Irving Blvd.	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 98.00	Yes
Blagg Tire and Service	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 98.00	Yes
Chastang Enterprises, Inc.	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 105.00	Yes
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 105.00	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

Reeder Distributors, Inc.	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$	125.00	Yes
---------------------------	--	----	--------	-----

17. Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service
--

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Bid Price	Award
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 130.00	Yes
Industrial Power	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 135.00	Yes
Rotex Truck Center, Inc.	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 139.00	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 150.00	Yes
CD Starter Service, LLC	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 150.00	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 150.00	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 160.00	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive/Fleet Maintenance Service	\$ 170.00	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 18. Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive Paint and Body Repair

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Bid Price	Award
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive Paint and Body Repair	\$ 52.00	Yes
Industrial Power	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive Paint and Body Repair	\$ 86.00	Yes
Rotex Truck Center pricelist	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive Paint and Body Repair	\$ 95.00	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive Paint and Body Repair	\$ 99.95	Yes
Toro Auto Sales	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive Paint and Body Repair	\$ 99.95	Yes
FleetPride Truck & Trailer Parts	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive Paint and Body Repair	\$ 105.00	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Hourly Labor Rate for Automotive Paint and Body Repair	\$ 170.00	Yes





## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

19. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Bus and Car Wash Equipment and Related Products (equipment and products necessary for a properly functioning Bus and Car Wash system)

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
American Sales and Service, Inc.	AmSales Power Washing Equipment pricelist	7%	Yes
Charter Chemical Solutions	Charter Chemical Solutions pricelist	15%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	20%	No
InterClean Equipment Inc.	InterClean Equipment pricelist	10%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist	5%	No
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	20%	No
College Station Auto Parts	Zep Chemicals pricelist (Chemicals Only)	50%	No



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 20. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Bus and Car Wash Supplies, Equipment and Parts

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
American Sales and Service, Inc.	AmSales Parts for Washing Equipment pricelist	7%	Yes
Charter Chemical Solutions	Charter Chemical Solutions Retail pricelist	15%	Yes
Gonzalez Auto Parts	Gonzalez Auto Parts pricelist	20%	No
InterClean Equipment Inc.	InterClean Equipment pricelist	10%	Yes
Kyrish Truck Center	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
R & S Texas Parts Co. - NAPA Floresville	R&S Texas Parts pricelist	5%	No
Toro Auto Sales	Toro Auto Sales pricelist	20%	No
Vanguard Truck Center of Austin	Vanguard pricelist	50%	No
College Station Auto Parts	Zep Chemicals pricelist (Chemicals Only)	50%	No



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 21. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Other Bus and Car Wash Equipment and Related Products

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
American Sales and Service, Inc.	AmSales pricelist	2%	Yes
Charter Chemical Solutions	Charter Chemical Solutions pricelist	15%	Yes
Delegard Tool of Texas, Inc.	Delegard Tool of Texas pricelist (5% discount to 40% discount)	5%	No
Kyrish Truck Center	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
Kyrish Truck Centers of Houston	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
Kyrish Truck Center of Victoria	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio	Major Fleet Customer Edition pricelist	0%	No
O'Reilly Auto Parts	O'Reilly pricelist	41%	No
College Station Auto Parts	Zep Chemicals pricelist (Chemicals Only)	50%	No



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 12/01/2020 to 11/30/2021

Final Catalog Award Report for Automotive Parts, Fluids, Maintenance and Equipment, Proposal No. 629-20

### 22. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Bus and Car Wash Maintenance/Warranty Agreements

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
American Sales and Service, Inc.	AmSales BuyBoard Bus and Car Wash Maintenance pricelist	0%	Yes
InterClean Equipment Inc.	InterClean Equipment pricelist	10%	Yes

### 23. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Fleet Vehicle Mobile Washing Services (services for washing and cleaning cars, trucks, vans, buses, and other fleet vehicles.)

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

### 24. Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair of Bus and Car Wash Equipment and Products

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Bid Pricelist	Award
American Sales and Service, Inc.	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair of Bus and Car Wash Equipment and Products	\$ 99.00	Yes
InterClean Equipment Inc.	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair of Bus and Car Wash Equipment and Products	\$ 140.00	Yes
Vanguard Truck Center of Austin	Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair of Bus and Car Wash Equipment and Products	\$ 145.00	No