



# The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

## 1. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for CIPP Mainline Rehabilitation Gravity Applications and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
BLD Services LLC	BLD Services pricelist (0% discount to 25% discount)	0%	Yes
Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC	Insight Pipe Contracting pricelist	0%	Yes
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	No
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

## 2. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Pipe Bursting Rehabilitation and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

## 3. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Structure (Manhole) Rehabilitation and Corrosion Protection and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	7%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 4. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Bypass for Gravity Pipelines and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
BLD Services LLC	BLD Services pricelist (0% discount to 25% discount)	0%	Yes
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	No
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 5. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Clean/TV and Evaluation for Gravity Pipelines and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
BLD Services LLC	BLD Services pricelist (0% discount to 25% discount)	0%	Yes
Compliance EnviroSystems, LLC	Compliance EnviroSystems pricelist	0%	No
Dukes Root Control, Inc	Duke's Root Control pricelist	0%	No
Insight Pipe Contracting	Insight Pipe Contracting pricelist	0%	Yes
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
Taplin Group, LLC	Taplin Group pricelist	5%	No
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 6. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Excavation and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 7. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for HDPE Tight Fitting Liner (IPS diameters) and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes

### 8. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Polyester Reinforced Polyethylene (PRP) Pipe Liner and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 9. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for CIPP Pressure Pipe Lining for Potable and Non-Potable Pressure Pipelines and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 10. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Pressure Pipeline Bypass and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 11. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Line Cleaning and Inspection for Pressure Pipelines and Mechanical Cleaning and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
Taplin Group, LLC	Taplin Group pricelist	5%	No
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 12. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Internal/External CFRP/GFRP For Pressure Pipe and Cast in Place Concrete and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes

### 13. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Gravity Sewer Lateral Renewal Systems and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
BLD Services LLC	BLD Services pricelist (0% discount to 25% discount)	0%	Yes
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	No
BLD Services LLC	Vacuum Excavated Cleanout Installation pricelist (0% discount to 25% discount)	0%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 14. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Manhole, Access Portals, Wet Well and Lift Station Renewal and Surface Cleaning Systems and Related Items.

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	5%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 15. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Horizontal Directional Drilling (HDD) and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 16. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Glass Fiber Reinforced Polymer (GFRP) and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes

### 17. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Carbon Fiber Reinforced Polymer (CFRP) and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes

### 18. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Concrete Clearing and Removal from Sewer Lines and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	No
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 19. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for All Other Underground Construction and Supplemental Items and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
BLD Services LLC	BLD Services, LLC Mobilization pricelist	0%	Yes
BLD Services LLC	BLD Services, LLC Traffic Control pricelist (Cost plus 10\$)	0%	No
Insituform Technologies, Inc.	Insituform pricelist	0%	Yes
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	IPR South Central BuyBoard catalog	0%	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 20. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for UV Light Cured Spiral Wound Fiberglass Liner for CIPP Mainline Rehabilitation Gravity Applications and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	No
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 21. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Pipe Bursting Rehabilitation and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 22. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Structure (Manhole) Rehabilitation and Corrosion Protection and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	5%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 23. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Bypass for Gravity Pipelines and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	No
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 24. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Clean/TV and Evaluation for Gravity Pipelines and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Compliance EnviroSystems, LLC	Compliance EnviroSystems pricelist	0%	No
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Taplin Group, LLC	Taplin Group pricelist	5%	No
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes





## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 25. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Excavation and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 26. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for HDPE Tight Fitting Liner (IPS diameters) and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes

### 27. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Polyester Reinforced Polyethylene (PRP) Pipe Liner and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	No

### 28. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for CIPP Pressure Pipe Lining for Potable and Non-Potable Pressure Pipelines and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 29. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Pressure Pipeline Bypass and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 30. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Line Cleaning and Inspection for Pressure Pipelines and Mechanical Cleaning and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
Taplin Group, LLC	Taplin Group pricelist	5%	No
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 31. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Storm Water Quality Pond Maintenance and Renewal and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC catalog	5%	No

### 32. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Gravity Sewer Lateral Renewal Systems and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	No
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 33. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Manhole, Access Portals, Wet Well and Lift Station Renewal and Surface Cleaning Systems and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	5%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 34. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Horizontal Directional Drilling (HDD) and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 35. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Glass Fiber Reinforced Polymer (GFRP) and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

### 36. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Carbon Fiber Reinforced Polymer (CFRP) and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

### 37. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Concrete Clearing and Removal from Sewer Lines and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	No
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

### 38. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Other Underground Construction and Supplemental Items and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes



# The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

## 39. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Pipe Sealing of Sanitary Sewer Pipes and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
BLD Services LLC	BLD Services pricelist (0% discount to 25% discount)	0%	Yes
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Uretek ICR Gulf Coast	Uretek ICR Gulf Coast BuyBoard pricelist	0%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

## 40. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Sealing of RCP or CMP Storm Sewer Joints and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	5%	Yes
Uretek ICR Gulf Coast	Uretek ICR Gulf Coast BuyBoard pricelist	0%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes

## 41. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Sealing of Box Culvert Storm Sewer Joints and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Kleen Pipe BuyBoard pricelist	5%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	5%	Yes
Uretek ICR Gulf Coast	Uretek ICR Gulf Coast BuyBoard pricelist	0%	Yes
Vortex Services, LLC	Vortex Services pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 42. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Manhole Seal/Stabilization and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Uretek ICR Gulf Coast	Uretek ICR Gulf Coast BuyBoard pricelist	0%	Yes

### 43. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Inlet/Catch Basin Stabilization and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Uretek ICR Gulf Coast	Uretek ICR Gulf Coast BuyBoard pricelist	0%	Yes

### 44. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Pavement Lifting and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	2%	Yes
Uretek ICR Gulf Coast	Uretek ICR Gulf Coast BuyBoard pricelist	0%	Yes

### 45. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Levee Stabilization and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Uretek ICR Gulf Coast	Uretek ICR Gulf Coast BuyBoard pricelist	0%	Yes

### 46. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Trench Stabilization and Related Items

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Uretek ICR Gulf Coast	Uretek ICR Gulf Coast BuyBoard pricelist	0%	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

**47. Discount (%) Off Catalog/Pricelist for Lift Stations, Clarifiers, Water Tanks, Hydro Tanks, Miscellaneous Building and Related Items**

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Fuquay, Inc.	Fuquay, Inc. pricelist	7%	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	National Water Main Cleaning Company pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	Yes
Uretek ICR Gulf Coast	Uretek ICR Gulf Coast BuyBoard pricelist	0%	Yes

**48. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Sewer Grease Liquefying Agent and Related Items**

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Dukes Root Control, Inc	Duke's Rooted In Innovation pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	No

**49. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Sewer Line Chemical Root Control and Related Items**

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Percent Discount	Award
Dukes Root Control, Inc	Duke's Rooted In Innovation pricelist	0%	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	TGU pricelist	3%	No

**50. Not to Exceed Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products**

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Bid Price	Award
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	Not to Exceed Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 60.00	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	Not to Exceed Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 75.00	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Not to Exceed Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 75.00	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Not to Exceed Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 75.00	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	Not to Exceed Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 167.95	Yes
Fuquay, Inc.	Not to Exceed Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 225.00	Yes



## The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

For the Period 03/01/2021 to 02/28/2022

Final Catalog Award Report for Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP) for Pipeline Rehabilitation, Proposal No. 635-21

### 51. Not to Exceed Non-Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Bid Price	Award
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	Not to Exceed Non-Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 90.00	Yes
Kleen Pipe	Not to Exceed Non-Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 112.50	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	Not to Exceed Non-Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 225.00	Yes
Fuquay, Inc.	Not to Exceed Non-Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 225.00	Yes
Southern Trenchless Solutions, LLC	Not to Exceed Non-Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 225.00	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	Not to Exceed Non-Standard Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 322.50	Yes

### 52. Coefficient for Non-Standard Hours for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Coefficient	Award
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	Coefficient for Non-Standard Hours for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 0.84	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	Coefficient for Non-Standard Hours for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 1.00	Yes
Fuquay, Inc.	Coefficient for Non-Standard Hours for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 1.00	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	Coefficient for Non-Standard Hours for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 1.85	Yes

### 53. Coefficient for Non-Standard Hours for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products

Vendor Name	Vendor Catalog Information	Coefficient	Award
PM Construction & Rehab, LLC	Coefficient for Non-Standard Hours for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 0.93	Yes
T. Gray Utility & Rehab Co.	Coefficient for Non-Standard Hours for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 1.00	Yes
Fuquay, Inc.	Coefficient for Non-Standard Hours for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 1.00	Yes
National Water Main Cleaning Company	Coefficient for Non-Standard Hours for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products	\$ 3.35	Yes